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Looking at some of the Shakespearean comedies, author John Vyvyan suggests they express a consistent,
profoundly Christian philosophy of life based on the Platonic ideas of beauty and love. In A Midsummer
Night’s Dream, As You Like It, and All’s Well That Ends Well, the heroines bring to life the idea of love as
the force that is awakened in the world by beauty which then leads the soul to perfection. Vyvyan believes
that for Shakespeare, love was preeminent over human ideas of justice, that self-discovery was a supreme
human experience, and that breaking faith with the ideal—as Agamemnon, Cressida, and Hector all do in
Troilus and Cressida —sowed the seeds of tragedy. The author’s recognition of Shakespeare's use of
allegory enables him to make sense of certain developments in these plays that seem weak or absurd from
the psychological standpoint. He does not suggest that Shakespeare’s philosophy is the most important thing
about his plays; it is simply one thing about them that ought to be known. The recognition of this philosophy
enhances enjoyment of the plays, giving them a new dimension and richness. This edition contains a list of
the author’s Shakespearean references and an enhanced index.
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From reader reviews:

Brandon Harmon:

Hey guys, do you would like to finds a new book to see? May be the book with the headline Shakespeare and
Platonic Beauty (Vyvyan's Shakespearean Trilogy) suitable to you? Often the book was written by renowned
writer in this era. The book untitled Shakespeare and Platonic Beauty (Vyvyan's Shakespearean Trilogy)is
the main of several books that everyone read now. That book was inspired lots of people in the world. When
you read this book you will enter the new way of measuring that you ever know prior to. The author
explained their concept in the simple way, therefore all of people can easily to recognise the core of this
book. This book will give you a great deal of information about this world now. To help you see the
represented of the world in this particular book.

Brian Alexander:

Spent a free time to be fun activity to do! A lot of people spent their free time with their family, or their
friends. Usually they undertaking activity like watching television, planning to beach, or picnic from the
park. They actually doing ditto every week. Do you feel it? Will you something different to fill your own
free time/ holiday? Could be reading a book may be option to fill your free time/ holiday. The first thing you
ask may be what kinds of book that you should read. If you want to consider look for book, may be the e-
book untitled Shakespeare and Platonic Beauty (Vyvyan's Shakespearean Trilogy) can be excellent book to
read. May be it might be best activity to you.

Jessica Jennings:

A lot of people always spent their own free time to vacation or perhaps go to the outside with them family or
their friend. Do you know? Many a lot of people spent they will free time just watching TV, or playing video
games all day long. If you wish to try to find a new activity this is look different you can read the book. It is
really fun in your case. If you enjoy the book which you read you can spent the entire day to reading a
reserve. The book Shakespeare and Platonic Beauty (Vyvyan's Shakespearean Trilogy) it is rather good to
read. There are a lot of people that recommended this book. They were enjoying reading this book. In case
you did not have enough space to deliver this book you can buy the e-book. You can m0ore quickly to read
this book through your smart phone. The price is not to fund but this book features high quality.

Walter Harman:

Reserve is one of source of information. We can add our information from it. Not only for students but native
or citizen want book to know the change information of year in order to year. As we know those books have
many advantages. Beside many of us add our knowledge, can also bring us to around the world. From the
book Shakespeare and Platonic Beauty (Vyvyan's Shakespearean Trilogy) we can have more advantage.
Don't someone to be creative people? To get creative person must prefer to read a book. Just choose the best
book that acceptable with your aim. Don't be doubt to change your life by this book Shakespeare and



Platonic Beauty (Vyvyan's Shakespearean Trilogy). You can more desirable than now.
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