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Over the past decade, a small group of economists has challenged traditional wisdom about international
trade. "Rethinking International Trade provides a coherent account of this research program and traces the
key steps in an exciting new trade theory that offers, among other possibilities, new arguments against free
trade. Krugman's introduction is a valuable guide to research that has delved anew into the causes of
international trade and reopened basic questions about the international pattern of specialization, the effects
of protectionism, and what constitutes an optimal trade policy In the four sections that follow, he takes a
revisionary look at the causes of international trade, and discusses growth and the role of history,
technological change and trade, and strategic trade policy. Essays in part I review and challenge the theories
of Ricardo and his successors, rethinking a 160-year tradition of looking at international trade. Models are
presented in which trade frequently arises because of opportunities to exploit increasing returns through
exports rather than from comparative advantage. In part II, Krugman traces the resulting pattern of trade
specialization not only to the influence of comparative advantage but also to more arbitrary factors such as
historical events, the rachet effect of cumulative processes, technological changes, and temporary economic
shocks. Part III expands on the theme of technological change as a key factor in determining the pattern of
specialization in international trade and addresses questions about the effects of innovation, or lack of it, on a
country's international trade position. The concluding essays examine the issue of protectionismalong with
other elements of trade policy, showing how protectionist policies, used as an export enhancement device by
some national governments, may shift world specialization to the advantage of the protectionist nations. Paul
R. Krugman is Professor of Economics at MIT.
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From reader reviews:

Maria Gardner:

Do you have favorite book? If you have, what is your favorite's book? Guide is very important thing for us to
know everything in the world. Each e-book has different aim or even goal; it means that publication has
different type. Some people experience enjoy to spend their the perfect time to read a book. They are really
reading whatever they get because their hobby will be reading a book. Think about the person who don't like
reading a book? Sometime, individual feel need book when they found difficult problem or perhaps exercise.
Well, probably you should have this Rethinking International Trade.

Frank Lantz:

What do you think of book? It is just for students since they're still students or the item for all people in the
world, exactly what the best subject for that? Simply you can be answered for that question above. Every
person has different personality and hobby for each and every other. Don't to be pressured someone or
something that they don't would like do that. You must know how great along with important the book
Rethinking International Trade. All type of book can you see on many options. You can look for the internet
sources or other social media.

Denise Swann:

The book untitled Rethinking International Trade is the guide that recommended to you to read. You can see
the quality of the reserve content that will be shown to a person. The language that author use to explained
their way of doing something is easily to understand. The article author was did a lot of research when write
the book, to ensure the information that they share for your requirements is absolutely accurate. You also
might get the e-book of Rethinking International Trade from the publisher to make you far more enjoy free
time.

Chelsie Salls:

Reading a book to become new life style in this season; every people loves to learn a book. When you study
a book you can get a lots of benefit. When you read guides, you can improve your knowledge, since book
has a lot of information on it. The information that you will get depend on what forms of book that you have
read. In order to get information about your examine, you can read education books, but if you act like you
want to entertain yourself look for a fiction books, these kinds of us novel, comics, and also soon. The
Rethinking International Trade provide you with new experience in reading through a book.
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