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What kind of leaders should we follow? What kind of leaders should we be? And what does God have to do
with it? These are some of the questions inherent in 1 Samuel, with its portrait of divine response to ancient
Israel's leadership crisis. That crisis was met through three men-Samuel, Saul, and David-in ways that
forever changed the character of Israel's leadership and clarified what God requires of his people and their
leaders.

As John Woodhouse demonstrates, 1 Samuel's biblical context provides serious reflection on our need for
leadership and the failure of human leaders. But it also reveals God's answer for Israel, which turns out to be
his answer for the whole world and for each of us individually. This perceptive commentary not only
illumines Old Testament history but brilliantly points to the New Testament promise that was fulfilled in
Jesus, our sovereign leader and Savior. Part of the Preaching the Word series.
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From reader reviews:

Blair Kennedy:

The book 1 Samuel: Looking for a Leader (Preaching the Word) can give more knowledge and also the
precise product information about everything you want. Why must we leave the good thing like a book 1
Samuel: Looking for a Leader (Preaching the Word)? A number of you have a different opinion about e-
book. But one aim this book can give many info for us. It is absolutely right. Right now, try to closer with
the book. Knowledge or information that you take for that, you can give for each other; you are able to share
all of these. Book 1 Samuel: Looking for a Leader (Preaching the Word) has simple shape nevertheless, you
know: it has great and massive function for you. You can appearance the enormous world by open up and
read a e-book. So it is very wonderful.

James Brier:

Information is provisions for people to get better life, information these days can get by anyone in
everywhere. The information can be a understanding or any news even restricted. What people must be
consider whenever those information which is within the former life are hard to be find than now's taking
seriously which one is acceptable to believe or which one typically the resource are convinced. If you receive
the unstable resource then you have it as your main information you will have huge disadvantage for you. All
of those possibilities will not happen inside you if you take 1 Samuel: Looking for a Leader (Preaching the
Word) as your daily resource information.

Donald Wexler:

Is it you actually who having spare time after that spend it whole day by means of watching television
programs or just resting on the bed? Do you need something new? This 1 Samuel: Looking for a Leader
(Preaching the Word) can be the reply, oh how comes? The new book you know. You are thus out of date,
spending your time by reading in this brand new era is common not a geek activity. So what these textbooks
have than the others?

Audrey Patton:

A number of people said that they feel weary when they reading a e-book. They are directly felt this when
they get a half regions of the book. You can choose the actual book 1 Samuel: Looking for a Leader
(Preaching the Word) to make your own personal reading is interesting. Your skill of reading ability is
developing when you similar to reading. Try to choose very simple book to make you enjoy you just read it
and mingle the feeling about book and studying especially. It is to be first opinion for you to like to open a
book and study it. Beside that the guide 1 Samuel: Looking for a Leader (Preaching the Word) can to be your
friend when you're experience alone and confuse with the information must you're doing of these time.
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