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This is reprint of a textbook for students of Soviet special geological schools and many be of use to
geologists and geophysics.

The book sums up and presents in popular form materials collected by the authors in the course of many
years of research on the territory of the U.S.S.R. and in other countries of the world.

It gives the principal information on the figure, dimensions and the age of the earth, considers external
dynamic processes (the geological work of wind, of surface and underground waters, glaciers, seas, lakes and
weathering processes) and internal dynamic processes (tectonic dislocations, oscillatory movements,
earthquakes, magmatism, metamorphism, etc.).

This book has been written by noted Soviet geologists Georgi Gorshkov and Alexandra Yakushova.

Professor Gorshkov, Doctor of Geological and Mineralogical Sciences, at the time of original publication
headed the Chair of Dynamic Geology of the Geological Department of the Moscow State University. He
has worked mainly in the field of seismotectonics on such problems as the geological conditions of the
occurrence of earthquakes and seismic zoning of various territories of the U.S.S.R., China, Burma, Japan,
Africa, and other regions. He is the author of 88 printed works, books and articles in various periodical
publications and scientific symposiums, most widely known of which are: "Earthquakes on the Territory of
the Soviet Union," "Seismotectonics and Seismic Zoning on the Territory of Burma," "A Course of Lectures
on the Fundamentals of Seismotectonics."

Alexandra Yakushova, Candidate of Geological and Mineralogical Scineces, Professor of the Chair of
Dynamic Geology of the Geological Department of the Moscow State University. Such works of hers as
"Methodics of Strutural-Geomorphological Studies in Prospecting for Oil and Gas," "History of Recent
Geological Development of the Eastern Sub-Caucasian and Northern Cis-Caspian Regions," "Formation and
Destruction of Mountains," and "Neotectonics of Eastern and Central Sub-Caucasian Regions" are very
popular among students of higher schools where geology is the main subject.
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From reader reviews:

Agustin Thornsberry:

The book Physical geology can give more knowledge and information about everything you want. Exactly
why must we leave a good thing like a book Physical geology? Several of you have a different opinion about
reserve. But one aim that book can give many information for us. It is absolutely appropriate. Right now, try
to closer together with your book. Knowledge or facts that you take for that, you are able to give for each
other; you can share all of these. Book Physical geology has simple shape nevertheless, you know: it has
great and massive function for you. You can seem the enormous world by start and read a book. So it is very
wonderful.

Ward Bishop:

Nowadays reading books become more and more than want or need but also get a life style. This reading
addiction give you lot of advantages. The huge benefits you got of course the knowledge the rest of the
information inside the book which improve your knowledge and information. The details you get based on
what kind of book you read, if you want attract knowledge just go with education books but if you want
sense happy read one along with theme for entertaining for instance comic or novel. The actual Physical
geology is kind of e-book which is giving the reader unforeseen experience.

Belinda Tenney:

People live in this new moment of lifestyle always attempt to and must have the extra time or they will get
great deal of stress from both everyday life and work. So , if we ask do people have time, we will say
absolutely indeed. People is human not really a huge robot. Then we inquire again, what kind of activity are
there when the spare time coming to anyone of course your answer will probably unlimited right. Then ever
try this one, reading publications. It can be your alternative with spending your spare time, the particular
book you have read is definitely Physical geology.

Florinda Redfern:

Beside this Physical geology in your phone, it might give you a way to get closer to the new knowledge or
data. The information and the knowledge you will got here is fresh from your oven so don't always be worry
if you feel like an previous people live in narrow town. It is good thing to have Physical geology because this
book offers to you personally readable information. Do you occasionally have book but you don't get what
it's all about. Oh come on, that will not end up to happen if you have this in the hand. The Enjoyable set up
here cannot be questionable, similar to treasuring beautiful island. Techniques you still want to miss that?
Find this book in addition to read it from today!
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