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In the late nineteenth century French obstetricians reported that a new medical device, the infant incubator,
made possible the rearing of premature infants whose prospects until then had been nearly hopeless. The
announcement set off a wave of enthusiasm that swept the United States. Hospitals opened the first
premature infant nurseries, and incubator shows (complete with live infants) opened in numerous public fairs
and expositions. Yet Americans did more than adopt the incubator; they reinvented it in the process. A
simple domestic warming device became a complex life-support system intended to provide a complete
artificial environment for the premature infant.

In The Machine in the Nursery Jeffrey Baker examines the transformation that overtook the incubator after it
arrived from France in the United States. He argues that the apparatus furnishes an example of how social
and cultural factors can fundamentally alter the evolution of medical technology. The analysis centers on the
interaction between the technology and its intended "target," the premature infant.

To the extent that particular medical specialists in distinct institutions and cultures saw different populations
of such infants, they were bound to interpret the incubator's purpose differently. The factors of institutional,
professional, and national context?along with that of gender?were of special importance in shaping
physicians' attitudes. Taken together, these elements enable us to understand the complex "branching"
pattern that characterized development of the incubator in the early twentieth century.
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From reader reviews:

Lisa Gaither:

Nowadays reading books be a little more than want or need but also work as a life style. This reading
addiction give you lot of advantages. Advantages you got of course the knowledge your information inside
the book this improve your knowledge and information. The details you get based on what kind of
publication you read, if you want have more knowledge just go with education and learning books but if you
want feel happy read one having theme for entertaining such as comic or novel. The The Machine in the
Nursery: Incubator Technology and the Origins of Newborn Intensive Care (Johns Hopkins Studies in the
History of Technology) is kind of guide which is giving the reader unforeseen experience.

David Busby:

Often the book The Machine in the Nursery: Incubator Technology and the Origins of Newborn Intensive
Care (Johns Hopkins Studies in the History of Technology) will bring you to the new experience of reading a
book. The author style to elucidate the idea is very unique. If you try to find new book to read, this book very
suited to you. The book The Machine in the Nursery: Incubator Technology and the Origins of Newborn
Intensive Care (Johns Hopkins Studies in the History of Technology) is much recommended to you to learn.
You can also get the e-book from your official web site, so you can easier to read the book.

Glady Curry:

A lot of reserve has printed but it is different. You can get it by online on social media. You can choose the
most effective book for you, science, witty, novel, or whatever by searching from it. It is known as of book
The Machine in the Nursery: Incubator Technology and the Origins of Newborn Intensive Care (Johns
Hopkins Studies in the History of Technology). You can add your knowledge by it. Without departing the
printed book, it may add your knowledge and make you actually happier to read. It is most crucial that, you
must aware about reserve. It can bring you from one destination for a other place.

Carmen Pinto:

A number of people said that they feel bored stiff when they reading a e-book. They are directly felt it when
they get a half areas of the book. You can choose the particular book The Machine in the Nursery: Incubator
Technology and the Origins of Newborn Intensive Care (Johns Hopkins Studies in the History of
Technology) to make your own reading is interesting. Your current skill of reading expertise is developing
when you just like reading. Try to choose very simple book to make you enjoy to see it and mingle the idea
about book and reading especially. It is to be initially opinion for you to like to open up a book and go
through it. Beside that the guide The Machine in the Nursery: Incubator Technology and the Origins of
Newborn Intensive Care (Johns Hopkins Studies in the History of Technology) can to be your brand new
friend when you're feel alone and confuse in doing what must you're doing of this time.
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