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The remarkable story of a father’s devotion to his wheelchair-bound son and how their bond inspired
millions of people worldwide.

Born a spastic quadraplegic, Rick Hoyt was written off by numerous doctors. They advised his parents, Dick
and Judy, to put their firstborn son in an institution. But Rick’s parents refused. Determined to give their son
every opportunity that “normal” kids had, they made sure to include Rick in everything they did, especially
with their other two sons, Rob and Russ.

But home was one thing, the world at large, another. Repeatedly rebuffed by school administrators who
resisted their attempts to enroll Rick in school, Rick’s mother worked tirelessly to help pass a landmark bill,
Chapter 766, the first special-education reform law in the country. As a result, Rick and other physically
disabled kids were able to attend public school in Massachusetts.

But how would Rick communicate when he couldn’t talk? To overcome this daunting obstacle, Dick and
Judy worked with Dr. William Crochetiere, then chairman of the engineering department at Tufts University,
and several enterprising graduate students, including Rick Foulds, to create the Tufts Interactive
Communication device (TCI). In the Hoyt household, it became known as the “Hope machine,” as it enabled
Rick to create sentences by pressing his head against a metal bar. For the first time ever, Rick was able to
communicate.
Then one day Rick asked his dad to enter a charity race, but there was a twist. Rick wanted to run too. Dick
had never run a race before, but more challenging still, he would have to push his son’s wheelchair at the
same time. But once again, the Hoyts were determined to overcome whatever obstacle was put in their way.

Now, over one thousand races later, including numerous marathons and triathlons, Dick Hoyt continues to
push Rick’s wheelchair. Affectionately known worldwide as Team Hoyt, they are as devoted as ever,
continuing to inspire millions and embodying their trademark motto of “Yes, you can.”
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From reader reviews:

Nicholas Hess:

Information is provisions for folks to get better life, information today can get by anyone on everywhere. The
information can be a know-how or any news even a problem. What people must be consider when those
information which is within the former life are challenging to be find than now is taking seriously which one
is suitable to believe or which one typically the resource are convinced. If you find the unstable resource then
you understand it as your main information it will have huge disadvantage for you. All of those possibilities
will not happen inside you if you take Devoted: The Story of a Father's Love for His Son as the daily
resource information.

Drew Dube:

This book untitled Devoted: The Story of a Father's Love for His Son to be one of several books which best
seller in this year, honestly, that is because when you read this reserve you can get a lot of benefit onto it.
You will easily to buy this book in the book retailer or you can order it by means of online. The publisher in
this book sells the e-book too. It makes you more readily to read this book, because you can read this book in
your Cell phone. So there is no reason to your account to past this book from your list.

Darren Perez:

The guide with title Devoted: The Story of a Father's Love for His Son contains a lot of information that you
can study it. You can get a lot of benefit after read this book. This specific book exist new expertise the
information that exist in this e-book represented the condition of the world today. That is important to yo7u
to learn how the improvement of the world. This book will bring you throughout new era of the
internationalization. You can read the e-book on the smart phone, so you can read it anywhere you want.

Harold Thompson:

Playing with family inside a park, coming to see the sea world or hanging out with friends is thing that
usually you may have done when you have spare time, after that why you don't try point that really opposite
from that. 1 activity that make you not sense tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller coaster you are ride
on and with addition of information. Even you love Devoted: The Story of a Father's Love for His Son, you
are able to enjoy both. It is very good combination right, you still wish to miss it? What kind of hang type is
it? Oh can occur its mind hangout guys. What? Still don't buy it, oh come on its called reading friends.
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