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A comic classic of world literature, Aleko Konstantinov’s 1895 novel Bai Ganyo follows the misadventures
of rose-oil salesman Ganyo Balkanski (“Bai” is a Bulgarian title of intimate respect) as he travels in Europe.
Unkempt but endearing, Bai Ganyo blusters his way through refined society in Vienna, Dresden, and St.
Petersburg with an eye peeled for pickpockets and a free lunch. Konstantinov’s satire turns darker when Bai
Ganyo returns home—bullying, bribing, and rigging elections in Bulgaria, a new country that had recently
emerged piecemeal from the Ottoman Empire with the help of Czarist Russia.
    Bai Ganyo has been translated into most European languages, but now Victor Friedman and his fellow
translators have finally brought this Balkan masterpiece to English-speaking readers, accompanied by a
helpful introduction, glossary, and notes.
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From reader reviews:

Travis Freeman:

As people who live in typically the modest era should be update about what going on or facts even
knowledge to make these individuals keep up with the era and that is always change and move forward.
Some of you maybe will probably update themselves by looking at books. It is a good choice to suit your
needs but the problems coming to a person is you don't know which one you should start with. This Bai
Ganyo: Incredible Tales of a Modern Bulgarian is our recommendation to help you keep up with the world.
Why, as this book serves what you want and need in this era.

Michael Quintanar:

The book untitled Bai Ganyo: Incredible Tales of a Modern Bulgarian is the guide that recommended to you
to learn. You can see the quality of the book content that will be shown to a person. The language that
publisher use to explained their way of doing something is easily to understand. The article writer was did a
lot of study when write the book, therefore the information that they share to you is absolutely accurate. You
also can get the e-book of Bai Ganyo: Incredible Tales of a Modern Bulgarian from the publisher to make
you more enjoy free time.

Rosa Rodriguez:

A lot of people always spent their free time to vacation or go to the outside with them family or their friend.
Are you aware? Many a lot of people spent they free time just watching TV, or perhaps playing video games
all day long. If you want to try to find a new activity honestly, that is look different you can read the book. It
is really fun for you. If you enjoy the book that you simply read you can spent the entire day to reading a
reserve. The book Bai Ganyo: Incredible Tales of a Modern Bulgarian it is rather good to read. There are a
lot of those who recommended this book. These folks were enjoying reading this book. In the event you did
not have enough space to bring this book you can buy the e-book. You can m0ore very easily to read this
book from a smart phone. The price is not to fund but this book has high quality.

Stephany Garcia:

In this era globalization it is important to someone to receive information. The information will make
someone to understand the condition of the world. The health of the world makes the information quicker to
share. You can find a lot of recommendations to get information example: internet, magazine, book, and
soon. You will see that now, a lot of publisher that will print many kinds of book. The particular book that
recommended for you is Bai Ganyo: Incredible Tales of a Modern Bulgarian this e-book consist a lot of the
information in the condition of this world now. This specific book was represented just how can the world
has grown up. The dialect styles that writer make usage of to explain it is easy to understand. Typically the
writer made some analysis when he makes this book. That's why this book acceptable all of you.
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