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While media buzz regularly circulates around iPhone and Android, Nokia still leads the pack in terms of
world market share. Symbian, for instance, remains the most widely used mobile operating system. With
Nokia's open development platform, the opportunities available for mobile developers to target this vastly
popular operating system are abundant and clear.

Use Qt to target both platforms: Symbian, the most widely used mobile operating system in the world, as●

well as MeeGo, the Intel/Nokia platform for mobile devices.
Develop HTML5 applications for both Symbian and MeeGo platforms that will run with little modification●

on other mobile platforms.
Novice developers learn the basics of Qt with a mobile slant, giving them the ability to target both desktop●

and mobile platforms.

What you’ll learn

How to do Qt basics●

What is QML or the Qt Markup Language●

What is Qt for Meego and how to use it●

and how to use it●

How to work with the Web Runtime●

Why mobile development is different●

How to port/support MeeGo and Symbian platforms●

Who this book is for

This must-have book is for mobile developers wanting to target the Meego and Symbian platforms (either as
the sole platform or in cross-platform development), and existing mobile developers wanting to start using
Qt.
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From reader reviews:

Bessie Morris:

What do you think about book? It is just for students since they are still students or that for all people in the
world, what best subject for that? Just you can be answered for that concern above. Every person has distinct
personality and hobby per other. Don't to be pressured someone or something that they don't need do that.
You must know how great and important the book Beginning Nokia Apps Development: Qt and HTML5 for
Symbian and MeeGo (Books for Professionals by Professionals). All type of book would you see on many
sources. You can look for the internet methods or other social media.

Maurice Neely:

What do you in relation to book? It is not important along with you? Or just adding material when you want
something to explain what you problem? How about your free time? Or are you busy man or woman? If you
don't have spare time to perform others business, it is make you feel bored faster. And you have spare time?
What did you do? Every individual has many questions above. They have to answer that question mainly
because just their can do that will. It said that about e-book. Book is familiar on every person. Yes, it is right.
Because start from on guardería until university need this particular Beginning Nokia Apps Development: Qt
and HTML5 for Symbian and MeeGo (Books for Professionals by Professionals) to read.

Charles Towns:

Your reading 6th sense will not betray an individual, why because this Beginning Nokia Apps Development:
Qt and HTML5 for Symbian and MeeGo (Books for Professionals by Professionals) e-book written by well-
known writer who knows well how to make book that may be understand by anyone who have read the
book. Written with good manner for you, still dripping wet every ideas and composing skill only for
eliminate your own personal hunger then you still skepticism Beginning Nokia Apps Development: Qt and
HTML5 for Symbian and MeeGo (Books for Professionals by Professionals) as good book not simply by the
cover but also by content. This is one e-book that can break don't determine book by its deal with, so do you
still needing an additional sixth sense to pick this kind of!? Oh come on your reading sixth sense already told
you so why you have to listening to an additional sixth sense.

Joseph Chitwood:

Reading a book to become new life style in this calendar year; every people loves to learn a book. When you
read a book you can get a wide range of benefit. When you read textbooks, you can improve your
knowledge, simply because book has a lot of information into it. The information that you will get depend on
what forms of book that you have read. If you need to get information about your examine, you can read
education books, but if you act like you want to entertain yourself you are able to a fiction books, these kinds
of us novel, comics, and soon. The Beginning Nokia Apps Development: Qt and HTML5 for Symbian and
MeeGo (Books for Professionals by Professionals) offer you a new experience in reading through a book.
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