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Stop riding aimlessly, day after day, week after week! Have you fallen into a rut, stuck doing the same thing
ride after ride? Maybe you feel like you can't challenge yourself or your horse. Or maybe you have lost sight
of setting goals and are floundering in your learning, trying one new skill, seeing little difference, and then
hopping onto the next bandwagon skill. Although auditing clinics or watching videos is always helpful, what
will really help is something to help you set and track your own personal progress. Goal Setting For The
Equestrian: A Personal Workbook is a guided planner that will help you devise your individualized goals and
milestones. Fill in the pages as you chart your progress over the course of a year. Everything you need to
keep track of the little steps and big milestones are here: - What rider improvement really means - The theory
behind setting positive, realistic goals - Set S.M.A.R.T. goals as they relate to horses and riding - Long term
planning - Short term planning - Journal style weekly entries - Special event debriefs This is a system
designed specifically for horse people seeking self-improvement in any equestrian pursuit (not only riding
related).
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From reader reviews:

Beverly Dewitt:

Throughout other case, little individuals like to read book Goal Setting For The Equestrian: A Personal
Workbook. You can choose the best book if you'd prefer reading a book. Provided that we know about how
is important the book Goal Setting For The Equestrian: A Personal Workbook. You can add knowledge and
of course you can around the world with a book. Absolutely right, simply because from book you can know
everything! From your country until foreign or abroad you will end up known. About simple issue until
wonderful thing you may know that. In this era, we are able to open a book or searching by internet product.
It is called e-book. You can use it when you feel weary to go to the library. Let's learn.

Quincy Eddy:

This Goal Setting For The Equestrian: A Personal Workbook is great publication for you because the content
which is full of information for you who else always deal with world and get to make decision every minute.
This book reveal it details accurately using great organize word or we can state no rambling sentences
included. So if you are read the idea hurriedly you can have whole info in it. Doesn't mean it only offers you
straight forward sentences but tough core information with lovely delivering sentences. Having Goal Setting
For The Equestrian: A Personal Workbook in your hand like having the world in your arm, facts in it is not
ridiculous one. We can say that no book that offer you world inside ten or fifteen second right but this book
already do that. So , this is good reading book. Heya Mr. and Mrs. occupied do you still doubt this?

Gerardo Whittaker:

Beside this specific Goal Setting For The Equestrian: A Personal Workbook in your phone, it may give you a
way to get nearer to the new knowledge or info. The information and the knowledge you are going to got
here is fresh in the oven so don't always be worry if you feel like an old people live in narrow community. It
is good thing to have Goal Setting For The Equestrian: A Personal Workbook because this book offers to
you personally readable information. Do you at times have book but you don't get what it's interesting
features of. Oh come on, that would not happen if you have this with your hand. The Enjoyable set up here
cannot be questionable, including treasuring beautiful island. Techniques you still want to miss it? Find this
book and read it from now!

Michelle Porter:

This Goal Setting For The Equestrian: A Personal Workbook is brand new way for you who has curiosity to
look for some information given it relief your hunger of information. Getting deeper you upon it getting
knowledge more you know or perhaps you who still having little bit of digest in reading this Goal Setting For
The Equestrian: A Personal Workbook can be the light food for you because the information inside this
particular book is easy to get through anyone. These books produce itself in the form that is reachable by
anyone, yep I mean in the e-book type. People who think that in reserve form make them feel tired even



dizzy this publication is the answer. So there is not any in reading a guide especially this one. You can find
what you are looking for. It should be here for a person. So , don't miss the item! Just read this e-book style
for your better life and also knowledge.
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