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In The Threatening Storm, Kenneth M. Pollack, one of the world’s leading experts on Iraq, provides a
masterly insider’s perspective on the crucial issues facing the United States as it moves toward a new
confrontation with Saddam Hussein.

For the past fifteen years, as an analyst on Iraq for the Central Intelligence Agency and the National Security
Council, Kenneth Pollack has studied Saddam as closely as anyone else in the United States. In 1990, he was
one of only three CIA analysts to predict the Iraqi invasion of Kuwait. As the principal author of the CIA’s
history of Iraqi military strategy and operations during the Gulf War, Pollack gained rare insight into the
methods and workings of what he believes to be the most brutal regime since Stalinist Russia.

Examining all sides of the debate and bringing a keen eye to the military and geopolitical forces at work,
Pollack ultimately comes to this controversial conclusion: through our own mistakes, the perfidy of others,
and Saddam’s cunning, the United States is left with few good policy options regarding Iraq. Increasingly,
the option that makes the most sense is for the United States to launch a full-scale invasion, eradicate
Saddam’s weapons of mass destruction, and rebuild Iraq as a prosperous and stable society—for the good of
the United States, the Iraqi people, and the entire region.

Pollack believed for many years that the United States could prevent Saddam from threatening the stability
of the Persian Gulf and the world through containment—a combination of sanctions and limited military
operations. Here, Pollack explains why containment is no longer effective, and why other policies intended
to deter Saddam ultimately pose a greater risk than confronting him now, before he gains possession of
nuclear weapons and returns to his stated goal of dominating the Gulf region. “It is often said that war should
be employed only in the last resort,” Pollack writes. “I reluctantly believe that in the case of the threat from
Iraq, we have come to the last resort.”

Offering a view of the region that has the authority and force of an intelligence report, Pollack outlines what
the leaders of neighboring Arab countries are thinking, what is necessary to gain their support for an
invasion, how a successful U.S. operation would be mounted, what the likely costs would be, and how
Saddam might react. He examines the state of Iraq today—its economy, its armed forces, its political system,
the status of its weapons of mass destruction as best we understand them, and the terrifying security
apparatus that keeps Saddam in power. Pollack also analyzes the last twenty years of relations between the
United States and Iraq to explain how the two countries reached the unhappy standoff that currently prevails.

Commanding in its insights and full of detailed information about how leaders on both sides will make their
decisions, The Threatening Storm is an essential guide to understanding what may be the crucial foreign
policy challenge of our time.
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From reader reviews:

Lola Taylor:

Why don't make it to be your habit? Right now, try to ready your time to do the important behave, like
looking for your favorite publication and reading a guide. Beside you can solve your long lasting problem;
you can add your knowledge by the reserve entitled The Threatening Storm: The Case for Invading Iraq. Try
to the actual book The Threatening Storm: The Case for Invading Iraq as your close friend. It means that it
can being your friend when you feel alone and beside that course make you smarter than in the past. Yeah, it
is very fortuned to suit your needs. The book makes you much more confidence because you can know every
little thing by the book. So , let's make new experience in addition to knowledge with this book.

Lois Silvey:

The reserve untitled The Threatening Storm: The Case for Invading Iraq is the guide that recommended to
you you just read. You can see the quality of the e-book content that will be shown to an individual. The
language that publisher use to explained their way of doing something is easily to understand. The article
writer was did a lot of analysis when write the book, and so the information that they share for your
requirements is absolutely accurate. You also will get the e-book of The Threatening Storm: The Case for
Invading Iraq from the publisher to make you considerably more enjoy free time.

Antonia Parham:

Spent a free the perfect time to be fun activity to perform! A lot of people spent their sparetime with their
family, or their particular friends. Usually they performing activity like watching television, likely to beach,
or picnic from the park. They actually doing same every week. Do you feel it? Do you wish to something
different to fill your own personal free time/ holiday? Could possibly be reading a book is usually option to
fill your totally free time/ holiday. The first thing that you'll ask may be what kinds of publication that you
should read. If you want to attempt look for book, may be the book untitled The Threatening Storm: The
Case for Invading Iraq can be excellent book to read. May be it may be best activity to you.

Reuben Beaubien:

This The Threatening Storm: The Case for Invading Iraq is brand new way for you who has attention to look
for some information because it relief your hunger associated with. Getting deeper you on it getting
knowledge more you know or else you who still having small amount of digest in reading this The
Threatening Storm: The Case for Invading Iraq can be the light food in your case because the information
inside this book is easy to get by means of anyone. These books acquire itself in the form which is reachable
by anyone, yep I mean in the e-book form. People who think that in publication form make them feel drowsy
even dizzy this publication is the answer. So there is absolutely no in reading a publication especially this
one. You can find what you are looking for. It should be here for anyone. So , don't miss this! Just read this
e-book kind for your better life as well as knowledge.
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