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This book introduces novel techniques and algorithms necessary to support the formation of social networks.
Concepts such as link prediction, graph patterns, recommendation systems based on user reputation, strategic
partner selection, collaborative systems and network formation based on ‘social brokers’ are presented.
Chapters cover a wide range of models and algorithms, including graph models and a personalized PageRank
model. Extensive experiments and scenarios using real world datasets from GitHub, Facebook, Twitter,
Google Plus and the European Union ICT research collaborations serve to enhance reader understanding of
the material with clear applications. Each chapter concludes with an analysis and detailed summary. Social
Network-Based Recommender Systems is designed as a reference for professionals and researchers working
in social network analysis and companies working on recommender systems. Advanced-level students
studying computer science, statistics or mathematics will also find this books useful as a secondary text.
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From reader reviews:

Kelsey Jimenez:

Now a day folks who Living in the era just where everything reachable by interact with the internet and the
resources inside it can be true or not demand people to be aware of each data they get. How individuals to be
smart in acquiring any information nowadays? Of course the answer is reading a book. Reading a book can
help folks out of this uncertainty Information specially this Social Network-Based Recommender Systems
book as this book offers you rich facts and knowledge. Of course the info in this book hundred per-cent
guarantees there is no doubt in it as you know.

Minerva Garrison:

A lot of people always spent their own free time to vacation as well as go to the outside with them family
members or their friend. Were you aware? Many a lot of people spent they free time just watching TV, or
even playing video games all day long. If you would like try to find a new activity honestly, that is look
different you can read some sort of book. It is really fun to suit your needs. If you enjoy the book that you
just read you can spent the whole day to reading a guide. The book Social Network-Based Recommender
Systems it is rather good to read. There are a lot of those who recommended this book. These were enjoying
reading this book. In case you did not have enough space bringing this book you can buy the actual e-book.
You can m0ore effortlessly to read this book from your smart phone. The price is not too expensive but this
book features high quality.

Mary Jacobs:

The book untitled Social Network-Based Recommender Systems contain a lot of information on the item.
The writer explains the girl idea with easy means. The language is very easy to understand all the people, so
do not necessarily worry, you can easy to read this. The book was written by famous author. The author will
bring you in the new era of literary works. You can easily read this book because you can read more your
smart phone, or gadget, so you can read the book throughout anywhere and anytime. If you want to buy the
e-book, you can open their official web-site along with order it. Have a nice go through.

Julio Huntsman:

Is it you who having spare time in that case spend it whole day by means of watching television programs or
just laying on the bed? Do you need something new? This Social Network-Based Recommender Systems can
be the answer, oh how comes? A book you know. You are therefore out of date, spending your time by
reading in this new era is common not a nerd activity. So what these textbooks have than the others?
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