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The robot Pentser is the last of his kind. Technology is obsolete. It only exists in museums and the
collections of oddballs like Govil. Govil is a 19th Century Romantic living in a 31st Century utopia, in a
Garden of Eden manufactured by GenieCorp™, meeting Mankind’s every need, whim, and fancy with
biological Creature Comforts™. Illness, war, poverty, famine, and death are gone. And so are love, parents,
children, and families. Were everyone is eternally happy, healthy, and wealthy; everyone but Govil. Like any
other decent 19th Century Romantic hero, Govil needs to discover a great love, a great cause, and Pentser is
game to help. Man and robot team up to do the unthinkable, create a deliberately average, normal woman,
Eve. In the conflict which ensues, Govil, Pentser, Eve, and GenieCorp™ each in turn experience the same
eternal law: beware of what you wish for, it may come true. EVE is Aurelio O’Brien’s vividly original,
sharp, sweet, and satirical tale of Govil’s adventure. Part Swift, part Shelley, and a little Shaw, EVE takes
place in a future that is both stunning and silly, beautiful and earthy, but at all times grounded in the obscure
psychology of human desire.
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From reader reviews:

Jessica Garcia:

In this 21st millennium, people become competitive in every way. By being competitive currently, people
have do something to make all of them survives, being in the middle of the particular crowded place and
notice through surrounding. One thing that sometimes many people have underestimated that for a while is
reading. Yep, by reading a reserve your ability to survive enhance then having chance to stand than other is
high. To suit your needs who want to start reading a new book, we give you this kind of Eve book as starter
and daily reading publication. Why, because this book is usually more than just a book.

Joan Rogers:

The publication with title Eve posesses a lot of information that you can discover it. You can get a lot of
advantage after read this book. This kind of book exist new expertise the information that exist in this guide
represented the condition of the world now. That is important to yo7u to learn how the improvement of the
world. This particular book will bring you in new era of the glowbal growth. You can read the e-book on
your own smart phone, so you can read it anywhere you want.

Ryan Calhoun:

Are you kind of active person, only have 10 or 15 minute in your moment to upgrading your mind talent or
thinking skill possibly analytical thinking? Then you are receiving problem with the book as compared to
can satisfy your small amount of time to read it because all this time you only find book that need more time
to be go through. Eve can be your answer since it can be read by an individual who have those short free
time problems.

Leticia Bennet:

Many people said that they feel bored stiff when they reading a publication. They are directly felt that when
they get a half portions of the book. You can choose the book Eve to make your own reading is interesting.
Your current skill of reading skill is developing when you like reading. Try to choose easy book to make you
enjoy to read it and mingle the opinion about book and reading especially. It is to be very first opinion for
you to like to available a book and learn it. Beside that the book Eve can to be your friend when you're sense
alone and confuse in what must you're doing of these time.
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