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Imagine escaping from the terrors of plantation slavery, only to live for years in a swamp full of biting
insects and deadly snakes. Picture yourself making a dangerous journey to freedom, guided by nothing but
courage and the North Star. Think of beginning a new life in a new country, only to fall prey to bounty
hunters.

The stories of the people who made up the Underground Railroad, that amazing network of quiet farm
houses, peaceful country lanes, and busy city streets that reached from the slave-owning areas of the
southern United States to the free states of the north and on to Canada, are among the most moving in our
history.

Meet some of the men and women who planned daring and ingenious ways to escape slavery, such as the
resourceful Henry Box Brown, who mailed himself to Philadelphia's Anti-Slavery Society in a box, and the
strong-willed Harriet Tubman, who fled with nothing more than a scrap of bread and the clothes on her back,
and then returned to the south year after year to help others find their way to freedom.

North Star to Freedom draws on the stories of the Underground Railroad's courageous passengers, whose
extraordinary spirit broke their own chains, and the brave conductors, who risked their lives to help others
simply because they believed that every person had the right to live free. More than just a book about the
worst injustices of slavery, North Star to Freedom is ultimately about resourcefulness, compassion, and hope.

Period posters, photographs, and paintings help to make North Star to Freedom a living history for readers of
all ages.
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From reader reviews:

Jerry Raminez:

Here thing why this North Star to Freedom: The Story of the Underground Railroad are different and
dependable to be yours. First of all examining a book is good however it depends in the content from it
which is the content is as delightful as food or not. North Star to Freedom: The Story of the Underground
Railroad giving you information deeper including different ways, you can find any reserve out there but there
is no book that similar with North Star to Freedom: The Story of the Underground Railroad. It gives you
thrill reading through journey, its open up your current eyes about the thing which happened in the world
which is might be can be happened around you. You can easily bring everywhere like in recreation area,
café, or even in your means home by train. When you are having difficulties in bringing the printed book
maybe the form of North Star to Freedom: The Story of the Underground Railroad in e-book can be your
alternative.

Patrick Duenas:

Do you certainly one of people who can't read pleasurable if the sentence chained inside straightway, hold on
guys this aren't like that. This North Star to Freedom: The Story of the Underground Railroad book is
readable by you who hate the perfect word style. You will find the data here are arrange for enjoyable
looking at experience without leaving possibly decrease the knowledge that want to deliver to you. The
writer associated with North Star to Freedom: The Story of the Underground Railroad content conveys
thinking easily to understand by many people. The printed and e-book are not different in the written content
but it just different available as it. So , do you still thinking North Star to Freedom: The Story of the
Underground Railroad is not loveable to be your top checklist reading book?

Donald Lewis:

Reading can called head hangout, why? Because while you are reading a book especially book entitled North
Star to Freedom: The Story of the Underground Railroad your mind will drift away trough every dimension,
wandering in each and every aspect that maybe mysterious for but surely will become your mind friends.
Imaging every word written in a book then become one application form conclusion and explanation that
maybe you never get ahead of. The North Star to Freedom: The Story of the Underground Railroad giving
you an additional experience more than blown away your head but also giving you useful data for your better
life within this era. So now let us teach you the relaxing pattern here is your body and mind will be pleased
when you are finished reading through it, like winning a. Do you want to try this extraordinary spending
spare time activity?

Daniel Watkins:

In this age globalization it is important to someone to obtain information. The information will make
professionals understand the condition of the world. The healthiness of the world makes the information



quicker to share. You can find a lot of references to get information example: internet, classifieds, book, and
soon. You will observe that now, a lot of publisher that will print many kinds of book. The book that
recommended to your account is North Star to Freedom: The Story of the Underground Railroad this
publication consist a lot of the information of the condition of this world now. This specific book was
represented how does the world has grown up. The terminology styles that writer value to explain it is easy
to understand. The particular writer made some analysis when he makes this book. That is why this book
appropriate all of you.
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