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Nouns, as Adjectives; by the treatment they experience from other Transitive Verbs, when being put into the
Accusative Case; and by the influence they themselves exercise on Nouns and Pronouns. As this subject,
however, belongs more properly to the Syntax, we shall leave it for the present. Before we leave this subject,
we beg to present to the Student those regular deviations which take place in those verbs whose third radical
letter is liable to change, by the accession of the vowels i and e, according to the rule laid down Part I. Ch.
VII. c. This occurs in verbs ending in A: Ills ft: 1": 1: H: Rs ID: R: and 0:, with (1) the Feminine of the 2d
pers. masc. in (a) the Present Indicative; (6) the Contingent Simple and Compound; (c) Subjunctive; (d)
Imperative; (2) with the 1st pers. sing, in the Constructive Simple and its Compounds. Instances: antEf: I
pounding &c (Dim.: mOR.AU' = I am (was) pounding.. (DITJPAU" 8. 1UIR: "he reproved," "chastised."
Ul£0: "he proceeded.1 changes are the same as in No. 7. The B. SECOND CONJUGATION, whose
characteristic is a prolongation of the first radical, by which it is changed from the first into the fourth form.
Its force is intensity of the idea of the original form. TiKfl: he scolded exceedingly. Its difference in form,
from the First Conjugation, is as follows: 1. It retains the first long radical throughout; on this acccount, it 2.
Has no peculiar form for the Subjunctive, but is served by the Contingent Mood. 3. In the Imperative, the
first radical is long, of the fourth: the second short, of the sixth order. '4. In the Infinitive, the first radical is
of the fourth; the second, as in all the conjugations, of the first order. The mode of conjugating being the
same as...
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From reader reviews:

Brenda Taylor:

In this 21st century, people become competitive in most way. By being competitive at this point, people have
do something to make these people survives, being in the middle of often the crowded place and notice by
means of surrounding. One thing that occasionally many people have underestimated this for a while is
reading. Yep, by reading a book your ability to survive improve then having chance to stand than other is
high. For yourself who want to start reading a book, we give you this kind of Grammar of the Amharic
language book as starter and daily reading book. Why, because this book is greater than just a book.

Samantha Williams:

Reading a book can be one of a lot of action that everyone in the world enjoys. Do you like reading book and
so. There are a lot of reasons why people love it. First reading a guide will give you a lot of new facts. When
you read a guide you will get new information because book is one of several ways to share the information
or perhaps their idea. Second, reading a book will make anyone more imaginative. When you looking at a
book especially fiction book the author will bring you to definitely imagine the story how the characters do it
anything. Third, you could share your knowledge to others. When you read this Grammar of the Amharic
language, you can tells your family, friends in addition to soon about yours publication. Your knowledge can
inspire the mediocre, make them reading a reserve.

Glenn Bail:

Reading a reserve tends to be new life style with this era globalization. With reading through you can get a
lot of information that could give you benefit in your life. With book everyone in this world can share their
idea. Books can also inspire a lot of people. Lots of author can inspire their particular reader with their story
or even their experience. Not only the story that share in the ebooks. But also they write about advantage
about something that you need illustration. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach your sons or
daughters, there are many kinds of book which exist now. The authors nowadays always try to improve their
talent in writing, they also doing some analysis before they write to the book. One of them is this Grammar
of the Amharic language.

Brian Crowe:

Publication is one of source of understanding. We can add our information from it. Not only for students but
in addition native or citizen will need book to know the up-date information of year to year. As we know
those publications have many advantages. Beside all of us add our knowledge, may also bring us to around
the world. With the book Grammar of the Amharic language we can acquire more advantage. Don't one to be
creative people? To get creative person must want to read a book. Just simply choose the best book that ideal
with your aim. Don't always be doubt to change your life with this book Grammar of the Amharic language.
You can more attractive than now.
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