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With a new title (following the successful first edition of Nations and Firms in the Global Economy), this
second edition undergraduate textbook combines the dual perspectives of international economics and
international business, providing a complete overview of the changing role of nations and firms in the global
economy. International Economics and Business covers the key concepts typically included in an
introductory course on the global economy, supported by contemporary case studies from the international
business world. The result is a practical guide to the world economy for undergraduate students in economics
and business, also suitable for students in other social science disciplines. Updated to include the latest
theoretical insights, data and case studies, with online quizzes, data exercises and additional reading,
International Economics and Business is a lively and engaging textbook providing a complete and practical
understanding of international economics and globalization through a uniquely integrated lens.
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From reader reviews:

Shawn Croll:

Information is provisions for people to get better life, information nowadays can get by anyone from
everywhere. The information can be a understanding or any news even a concern. What people must be
consider while those information which is in the former life are challenging be find than now could be taking
seriously which one works to believe or which one the particular resource are convinced. If you find the
unstable resource then you buy it as your main information you will have huge disadvantage for you. All
those possibilities will not happen in you if you take International Economics and Business as your daily
resource information.

Richard Pease:

Typically the book International Economics and Business will bring you to definitely the new experience of
reading the book. The author style to describe the idea is very unique. If you try to find new book to study,
this book very acceptable to you. The book International Economics and Business is much recommended to
you you just read. You can also get the e-book from official web site, so you can more easily to read the
book.

David Ramos:

This International Economics and Business is great publication for you because the content and that is full of
information for you who all always deal with world and possess to make decision every minute. This kind of
book reveal it information accurately using great manage word or we can state no rambling sentences within
it. So if you are read the item hurriedly you can have whole facts in it. Doesn't mean it only gives you
straight forward sentences but difficult core information with attractive delivering sentences. Having
International Economics and Business in your hand like having the world in your arm, facts in it is not
ridiculous one. We can say that no guide that offer you world with ten or fifteen moment right but this
reserve already do that. So , it is good reading book. Hi Mr. and Mrs. active do you still doubt that will?

Carmen Annunziata:

Reading a book for being new life style in this season; every people loves to learn a book. When you learn a
book you can get a lot of benefit. When you read publications, you can improve your knowledge, due to the
fact book has a lot of information on it. The information that you will get depend on what kinds of book that
you have read. If you want to get information about your review, you can read education books, but if you
want to entertain yourself read a fiction books, this kind of us novel, comics, in addition to soon. The
International Economics and Business provide you with a new experience in examining a book.
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