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Attacking Network Protocols is a deep-dive into network vulnerability discovery from James Forshaw,
Microsoft's top bug hunter. This comprehensive guide looks at networking from an attacker's perspective to
help you find, exploit, and ultimately protect vulnerabilities.

Part I starts with a rundown of networking basics and traffic capture, as it builds a foundation for analyzing a
network. Part II moves on to protocol analysis, both static and dynamic; you'll learn about common protocol
structures, cryptography, and protocol security, and how to reverse engineer code with IDA Pro, ILSpy, and
Javasnoop. Part III focuses on finding and exploiting vulnerabilities, including an overview of common bug
classes, fuzzing, debugging, exhaustion attacks, and how to develop custom tools. Forshaw ends with an
overview of the best tools for analyzing and exploiting networks. By the book's end, you'll have a deep
understanding of how to analyze network communication and where to look for vulnerabilities. You'll learn
how to:

Capture, manipulate, and spoof packets both passively and on the wire●

Create your own capture framework●

Reverse engineer code, brute force passwords, and decrypt traffic●

Exploit vulnerabilities with denial-of-service attacks, SQL injections, and memory corruptions●

Use protocol capture tools like IDA Pro, Wireshark, and CANAPE●

Strengthen your exploits by rerouting network traffic, exploiting compression, and controlling data flow●

Attacking Network Protocols is a must-have for any penetration tester, bug hunter, or developer looking to
exploit and secure network vulnerabilities.
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From reader reviews:

Scott Croft:

Throughout other case, little folks like to read book Attacking Network Protocols. You can choose the best
book if you appreciate reading a book. So long as we know about how is important a new book Attacking
Network Protocols. You can add knowledge and of course you can around the world by the book. Absolutely
right, simply because from book you can learn everything! From your country until finally foreign or abroad
you may be known. About simple factor until wonderful thing you can know that. In this era, we are able to
open a book or maybe searching by internet device. It is called e-book. You may use it when you feel bored
to go to the library. Let's read.

Ellen Omalley:

Book will be written, printed, or illustrated for everything. You can recognize everything you want by a
guide. Book has a different type. We all know that that book is important matter to bring us around the
world. Close to that you can your reading expertise was fluently. A book Attacking Network Protocols will
make you to be smarter. You can feel considerably more confidence if you can know about every little thing.
But some of you think that will open or reading some sort of book make you bored. It's not make you fun.
Why they may be thought like that? Have you in search of best book or acceptable book with you?

Mark Montague:

As people who live in often the modest era should be up-date about what going on or details even knowledge
to make all of them keep up with the era and that is always change and advance. Some of you maybe will
certainly update themselves by reading books. It is a good choice to suit your needs but the problems coming
to an individual is you don't know what kind you should start with. This Attacking Network Protocols is our
recommendation so you keep up with the world. Why, because this book serves what you want and wish in
this era.

Jose Lloyd:

Now a day those who Living in the era where everything reachable by talk with the internet and the
resources within it can be true or not demand people to be aware of each info they get. How individuals to be
smart in obtaining any information nowadays? Of course the answer then is reading a book. Examining a
book can help folks out of this uncertainty Information specially this Attacking Network Protocols book
since this book offers you rich data and knowledge. Of course the knowledge in this book hundred per cent
guarantees there is no doubt in it as you know.
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