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Civil War officer, Reconstruction "carpetbagger," best-selling novelist, and relentless champion of equal
rights--Albion Tourgée battled his entire life for racial justice. Now, in this engaging biography, Mark Elliott
offers an insightful portrait of a fearless lawyer, jurist, and writer, who fought for equality long after most
Americans had abandoned the ideals of Reconstruction. Elliott provides a fascinating account of Tourgée's
life, from his childhood in the Western Reserve region of Ohio (then a hotbed of abolitionism), to his years
as a North Carolina judge during Reconstruction, to his memorable role as lead plaintiff's counsel in the
landmark Supreme Court case Plessy v. Ferguson. Tourgée's brief coined the phrase that justice should be
"color-blind," and his career was one long campaign to make good on that belief. A redoubtable lawyer and
an accomplished jurist, Tourgée's writings represent a mountain of dissent against the prevailing tide of
racial oppression. A poignant and inspiring study in courage and conviction, Color-Blind Justice offers us an
unforgettable portrayal of Albion Tourgée and the principles to which he dedicated his life.
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From reader reviews:

Marilyn Daniels:

The ability that you get from Color Blind Justice: Albion Tourgée and the Quest for Racial Equality from the
Civil War to Plessy v. Ferguson is the more deep you searching the information that hide into the words the
more you get considering reading it. It doesn't mean that this book is hard to recognise but Color Blind
Justice: Albion Tourgée and the Quest for Racial Equality from the Civil War to Plessy v. Ferguson giving
you thrill feeling of reading. The copy writer conveys their point in specific way that can be understood by
anyone who read the idea because the author of this guide is well-known enough. This particular book also
makes your current vocabulary increase well. Making it easy to understand then can go along, both in printed
or e-book style are available. We propose you for having this specific Color Blind Justice: Albion Tourgée
and the Quest for Racial Equality from the Civil War to Plessy v. Ferguson instantly.

Juan Harrell:

The actual book Color Blind Justice: Albion Tourgée and the Quest for Racial Equality from the Civil War
to Plessy v. Ferguson has a lot info on it. So when you make sure to read this book you can get a lot of
benefit. The book was published by the very famous author. The writer makes some research previous to
write this book. This kind of book very easy to read you will get the point easily after reading this book.

Fred Howell:

People live in this new morning of lifestyle always try and and must have the spare time or they will get lots
of stress from both daily life and work. So , once we ask do people have spare time, we will say absolutely of
course. People is human not only a robot. Then we inquire again, what kind of activity do you have when the
spare time coming to you actually of course your answer will probably unlimited right. Then ever try this
one, reading textbooks. It can be your alternative inside spending your spare time, the book you have read
will be Color Blind Justice: Albion Tourgée and the Quest for Racial Equality from the Civil War to Plessy
v. Ferguson.

Tanya Nolan:

Reserve is one of source of information. We can add our information from it. Not only for students but native
or citizen need book to know the update information of year to year. As we know those ebooks have many
advantages. Beside we all add our knowledge, also can bring us to around the world. By book Color Blind
Justice: Albion Tourgée and the Quest for Racial Equality from the Civil War to Plessy v. Ferguson we can
acquire more advantage. Don't you to definitely be creative people? To get creative person must prefer to
read a book. Only choose the best book that appropriate with your aim. Don't possibly be doubt to change
your life with this book Color Blind Justice: Albion Tourgée and the Quest for Racial Equality from the Civil
War to Plessy v. Ferguson. You can more pleasing than now.
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