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* All you need to know about mixing watercolours * Explores all the different colour mixing techniques
including palette mixing, overlaying and wet-into-wet * Provides a visual source of over 600 watercolour
mixes * Fully annotated paintings throughout demonstrate the colours and mixes used. Colour is
fundamental to painting and the ability to mix and reproduce specific hues is an art in itself. Colour theory
can be dull and complicated, but in this book, experienced artist and teacher, Sharon Finmark, demonstrates
colour mixing in a practical and easy-to-follow way. In addition to being an extensive visual sourcebook to
nearly 600 colour mixes, there are paintings featured throughout with all the different hues and mixes in each
painting analysed and annotated. In this way, watercolour painters learn by application how to get the best
out of their paints.
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From reader reviews:

James Buscher:

What do you regarding book? It is not important along? Or just adding material when you require something
to explain what the one you have problem? How about your free time? Or are you busy man or woman? If
you don't have spare time to accomplish others business, it is make one feel bored faster. And you have extra
time? What did you do? Every individual has many questions above. They need to answer that question
because just their can do in which. It said that about guide. Book is familiar on every person. Yes, it is
proper. Because start from on kindergarten until university need that 600 Watercolour Mixes to read.

Richard Hunt:

The particular book 600 Watercolour Mixes has a lot info on it. So when you check out this book you can get
a lot of advantage. The book was authored by the very famous author. The writer makes some research
before write this book. This specific book very easy to read you can obtain the point easily after scanning
this book.

Wendy Clark:

Do you have something that you want such as book? The book lovers usually prefer to pick book like comic,
limited story and the biggest an example may be novel. Now, why not seeking 600 Watercolour Mixes that
give your satisfaction preference will be satisfied simply by reading this book. Reading addiction all over the
world can be said as the method for people to know world considerably better then how they react to the
world. It can't be mentioned constantly that reading habit only for the geeky man but for all of you who
wants to always be success person. So , for all of you who want to start studying as your good habit, you are
able to pick 600 Watercolour Mixes become your own starter.

Joan Freeman:

Don't be worry in case you are afraid that this book may filled the space in your house, you can have it in e-
book means, more simple and reachable. This particular 600 Watercolour Mixes can give you a lot of good
friends because by you checking out this one book you have issue that they don't and make you more like an
interesting person. This book can be one of one step for you to get success. This reserve offer you
information that possibly your friend doesn't recognize, by knowing more than other make you to be great
folks. So , why hesitate? Let us have 600 Watercolour Mixes.
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