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Dancing was an essential part of life in Shakespeare's England. Town and country folk danced at weddings,
Maydays and other festivities. Queen Elizabeth prided herself on her skill (and danced galliards in the
morning to keep fit), and dancing was the soul of the extravagant masques which so delighted King James.
Puritans might furiously denounce it but it was part of the ceremonial of the Inns of Court and a necessary
accomplishment for a gentleman. At the same time, as Alan Brissenden shows in this book, the dance was an
accepted symbol of harmony, and it was in this way that Shakespeare used it to express one of his major
themes: the attempt to achieve order in a discordant world. He included it in at least a dozen of his plays and
referred to it in thirty. A valuable source for his imagery, it also illuminates character and action and in some
plays helps to forward the plot. In the history plays allusions to country dance, (especially the morris, and
court dances like the lavolta) support ideas of conflict and the presentation of characters, especially Henry V.
While there is no dancing itself in the histories there is plenty to be found in the comedies and two chapters
of the book closely examine the relation of dance to dialogue, character and plot, particularly in "Love's
Labour's Lost", "A Midsummer Night's Dream" and "Much Ado About Nothing". In the tragedies dancing
becomes a powerful ironic visual symbol, especially in Romeo and Juliet, Macbeth and Timon of Athens.
After 1607 dance occurs in almost all of Shakespeare's plays, in such a way that it reflects and expresses the
fusion of tragic and comic elements which characterize most of them. The closing chapters show how the
dance relates to the cosmic ideas and imagery of these last plays from Perides to Henry VIII and suggest
certain influences from the spectacular court masques of the time. In presenting his argument the author, who
is a dance critic as well as an Elizabethan scholar, has drawn on manuscript sources, a wide range of
contemporary writing, including dance manuals, and his own ideas in dance and theatre. This is a book for
students and scholars, for editors, for theatre directors and for those interested in Renaissance dance. It is a
book for everyone who delights in the riches of Shakespeare and the age in which he lived.
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From reader reviews:

Jack Baldwin:

This Shakespeare and the Dance book is not really ordinary book, you have it then the world is in your
hands. The benefit you will get by reading this book is information inside this reserve incredible fresh, you
will get info which is getting deeper anyone read a lot of information you will get. This particular
Shakespeare and the Dance without we know teach the one who reading through it become critical in
considering and analyzing. Don't end up being worry Shakespeare and the Dance can bring when you are and
not make your case space or bookshelves' grow to be full because you can have it with your lovely laptop
even mobile phone. This Shakespeare and the Dance having fine arrangement in word along with layout, so
you will not really feel uninterested in reading.

Pearl Young:

This Shakespeare and the Dance are reliable for you who want to be described as a successful person, why.
The key reason why of this Shakespeare and the Dance can be one of many great books you must have is
definitely giving you more than just simple reading food but feed an individual with information that might
be will shock your prior knowledge. This book is handy, you can bring it just about everywhere and
whenever your conditions at e-book and printed kinds. Beside that this Shakespeare and the Dance giving
you an enormous of experience including rich vocabulary, giving you test of critical thinking that could it
useful in your day activity. So , let's have it and luxuriate in reading.

Dennis Gaines:

This book untitled Shakespeare and the Dance to be one of several books that best seller in this year, that is
because when you read this book you can get a lot of benefit onto it. You will easily to buy this book in the
book retail outlet or you can order it by means of online. The publisher of the book sells the e-book too. It
makes you quickly to read this book, since you can read this book in your Smart phone. So there is no reason
to your account to past this reserve from your list.

Christine Brooks:

Reading a book to be new life style in this yr; every people loves to go through a book. When you study a
book you can get a large amount of benefit. When you read books, you can improve your knowledge, mainly
because book has a lot of information in it. The information that you will get depend on what sorts of book
that you have read. In order to get information about your review, you can read education books, but if you
act like you want to entertain yourself you are able to a fiction books, these us novel, comics, and also soon.
The Shakespeare and the Dance provide you with a new experience in reading a book.
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