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Criminalized power structures (CPS) are illicit networks that profit from transactions in black markets and
from criminalized state institutions while perpetuating a culture of impunity. These criminalized power
structures are the predominant spoilers of peace settlements and stability operations. This volume focuses on
the means available to practitioners to cope with the challenges posed by CPS along with recommendations
for improving their efficacy and an enumeration of the conditions essential for their success. The means
range from economic sanctions and border controls to the use of social media and criminal intelligence-led
operations. Each step of this toolkit is detailed, explaining what each tool is, how it can be used, which type
of CPS it is best suited to address, and what is necessary to ensure success of the peace operations. The
effectiveness of the tool is also assessed and its use is illustrated through real life situations, such as
international supply chain controls to prevent the looting of natural resources in Western Africa or the
intervention of international judges and prosecutors in Kosovo.

A companion volume, Criminalized Power Structures: The Overlooked Enemies of Peace, articulates a
typology for assessing the threats of CPS illustrated by many case studies.
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From reader reviews:

Gregory Howard:

Here thing why that Combating Criminalized Power Structures: A Toolkit (Peace and Security in the 21st
Century) are different and trustworthy to be yours. First of all studying a book is good but it really depends
in the content than it which is the content is as delicious as food or not. Combating Criminalized Power
Structures: A Toolkit (Peace and Security in the 21st Century) giving you information deeper since different
ways, you can find any reserve out there but there is no e-book that similar with Combating Criminalized
Power Structures: A Toolkit (Peace and Security in the 21st Century). It gives you thrill reading through
journey, its open up your personal eyes about the thing that will happened in the world which is might be can
be happened around you. You can easily bring everywhere like in park, café, or even in your technique home
by train. In case you are having difficulties in bringing the imprinted book maybe the form of Combating
Criminalized Power Structures: A Toolkit (Peace and Security in the 21st Century) in e-book can be your
alternative.

Matthew McDaniel:

Your reading sixth sense will not betray you actually, why because this Combating Criminalized Power
Structures: A Toolkit (Peace and Security in the 21st Century) book written by well-known writer who really
knows well how to make book which might be understand by anyone who else read the book. Written in
good manner for you, leaking every ideas and publishing skill only for eliminate your hunger then you still
hesitation Combating Criminalized Power Structures: A Toolkit (Peace and Security in the 21st Century) as
good book not only by the cover but also with the content. This is one e-book that can break don't assess
book by its deal with, so do you still needing an additional sixth sense to pick this specific!? Oh come on
your examining sixth sense already told you so why you have to listening to another sixth sense.

Gail Delamora:

A lot of e-book has printed but it takes a different approach. You can get it by web on social media. You can
choose the top book for you, science, comedy, novel, or whatever by searching from it. It is named of book
Combating Criminalized Power Structures: A Toolkit (Peace and Security in the 21st Century). You'll be
able to your knowledge by it. Without departing the printed book, it could add your knowledge and make an
individual happier to read. It is most significant that, you must aware about e-book. It can bring you from
one destination to other place.

Pedro Lewis:

Some individuals said that they feel uninterested when they reading a publication. They are directly felt this
when they get a half areas of the book. You can choose the book Combating Criminalized Power Structures:
A Toolkit (Peace and Security in the 21st Century) to make your own personal reading is interesting. Your
own personal skill of reading talent is developing when you just like reading. Try to choose very simple book



to make you enjoy to learn it and mingle the feeling about book and examining especially. It is to be first
opinion for you to like to start a book and study it. Beside that the e-book Combating Criminalized Power
Structures: A Toolkit (Peace and Security in the 21st Century) can to be your brand-new friend when you're
experience alone and confuse in what must you're doing of these time.
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