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The United Nations counter - offensive against the North Korean Army was launched in the middle of
September 1950 with the X US Corps executing a successful amphibious envelopment at INCHON. In
conjunction with the INCHON landing the Eighth Army attacked north from the PUSAN perimeter and after
making a juncture with X Corps at the INCHON - SEOUL beachhead continued the exploitation north
toward the YALU River. During October, Eighth Army continued north to capture the North Korean Capital
at PYONGYANG while the I Republic of Korea Corps made a rapid advance along the East Coast of Korea.
Meanwhile, X Corps mounted a second amphibious envelopment, this time against the Northeast Korean
Coast. The capture of WONSAN and HUNGNAM, important east coast ports, by I Republic of Korea Corps
obviated assault landings by X Corps and Commanding General X Corp assumed command of all United
Nations Forces in the Northeast Zone of Korea on 20 October 1950. Following the debarkation of X Corps
elements, beginning 26 October, the 1st Marine Division and 7th Infantry Division entered the exploitation
phase against disintegrating North Korean resistance. The original mission of X Corps, to drive west after
landing to assist Eighth Army in the capture of PYONGYANG, had been changed to an offensive to the
North with the objective of reaching the Manchurian and USSR Borders as soon as pos¬sible. The sectors of
advance were the 1st Marine Division on the West, 7th Infantry Division in the center, and I Republic of
Korea Corps on the East. By the end of the third week of November the completion of this mis¬sion was in
sight. The 1st Marine Division had conducted vigorous anti-guerrilla operations in the WONSAN -
HAMHUNG area and had defeated elements of the 124th and 126th Chinese Communist Forces Divisions
north of HAMHUNG. After this battle, the 7th Marine Regiment had advanced north reaching the southern
tip of CHOSIN Reservoir on 14 November. On 6 November the 3d US Infantry Division, which was joining
X Corps from Japan, initiated relief of 1st Marine Division elements in the WONSAN area. This released the
bulk of the 1st Marine Division for its drive to the border. On 21 November, the 7th Infantry Division
reached the YALU River (this was the only Unit in X Corps to reach the border), while I Republic of Korea
Corps advancing Northeast completed the capture of the port of CHONGJIN on 25 November against the
only organized resistance in the Corps zone. Civil Affairs was making steady progress in organizing local
and provincial governments. United Nations Forces were enthusiastically received by the majority of the
population. In order to protect these governments, it was necessary to employ a substantial number of troops.
Likewise, the Military Supply Route's, railroads, and military installations required security against the
depredations of many bands of by-passed North Korean Army troops and guerril¬las. These guerrilla attacks,
while a problem, were not considered critical and it was felt that as soon as the Corps Zone was cleared of
organized resistance most of the guerrilla activity would cease. The presence of Chinese Communist Forces
in front of the 1st Marine Division was the imponderable in the Intelligence picture. On 28 October the 26th
Republic of Korea Regiment made the first contact with the Chinese Communist Forces in the area north of
HAMHUNG. The 7th Marine Regiment relieved the 26th Republic of Korea Regiment and by 14 November,
succeeded in defeating this Chinese Communist Forces covering force, but there were few indications of
their intentions and future plans. By the middle of November the plans of X Corps became dependent on the
plans for Eighth Army in the West, and a change in the X Corps mission was indicated. This change was
made necessary by the enemy buildup in front of Eighth Army and the halting by enemy action of the first
attempt in the second week of November to advance Eighth Army to the border
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From reader reviews:

James Collis:

Book is to be different per grade. Book for children until adult are different content. To be sure that book is
very important normally. The book Special Report on Chosin Reservoir 27 Nov to 10 Dec 1950:
Headquarters X CORPS Command Report seemed to be making you to know about other know-how and of
course you can take more information. It is very advantages for you. The e-book Special Report on Chosin
Reservoir 27 Nov to 10 Dec 1950: Headquarters X CORPS Command Report is not only giving you much
more new information but also to get your friend when you feel bored. You can spend your personal spend
time to read your e-book. Try to make relationship with the book Special Report on Chosin Reservoir 27
Nov to 10 Dec 1950: Headquarters X CORPS Command Report. You never sense lose out for everything if
you read some books.

Loretta Faria:

Nowadays reading books become more than want or need but also get a life style. This reading addiction
give you lot of advantages. The advantages you got of course the knowledge the particular information inside
the book which improve your knowledge and information. The information you get based on what kind of e-
book you read, if you want attract knowledge just go with schooling books but if you want feel happy read
one together with theme for entertaining such as comic or novel. Typically the Special Report on Chosin
Reservoir 27 Nov to 10 Dec 1950: Headquarters X CORPS Command Report is kind of reserve which is
giving the reader unforeseen experience.

Nicholas Sheen:

The e-book untitled Special Report on Chosin Reservoir 27 Nov to 10 Dec 1950: Headquarters X CORPS
Command Report is the e-book that recommended to you you just read. You can see the quality of the
reserve content that will be shown to you. The language that publisher use to explained their way of doing
something is easily to understand. The article author was did a lot of research when write the book, to ensure
the information that they share to your account is absolutely accurate. You also might get the e-book of
Special Report on Chosin Reservoir 27 Nov to 10 Dec 1950: Headquarters X CORPS Command Report
from the publisher to make you much more enjoy free time.

Margaret James:

Do you have something that you enjoy such as book? The guide lovers usually prefer to decide on book like
comic, quick story and the biggest the first is novel. Now, why not hoping Special Report on Chosin
Reservoir 27 Nov to 10 Dec 1950: Headquarters X CORPS Command Report that give your satisfaction
preference will be satisfied by means of reading this book. Reading practice all over the world can be said as
the opportunity for people to know world far better then how they react toward the world. It can't be said
constantly that reading addiction only for the geeky person but for all of you who wants to become success



person. So , for every you who want to start examining as your good habit, you can pick Special Report on
Chosin Reservoir 27 Nov to 10 Dec 1950: Headquarters X CORPS Command Report become your own
personal starter.
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