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THE SOCIAL WORK GRADUATE SCHOOL APPLICANT'S HANDBOOK

by Jesús Reyes, AM, ACSW

With a foreword by Congressman Ciro D. Rodriguez

Are you thinking about getting a master’s degree in social work?

Find out from author Jesús Reyes, a former admissions director, how you can improve your graduate school
application.

In THE SOCIAL WORK GRADUATE SCHOOL APPLICANT’S HANDBOOK, you will learn about the
admissions process from an insider’s perspective. You will discover what will help (and hurt) your chances
of being accepted to the school of your choice, and you will find tips on deciding which school is right for
you.

Read this book and find out:

• What factors to consider when determining your interest in a school of social work

• What admissions committees look for in an applicant

• Whether your GPA and test scores matter

• How to gain social work related experience that will help your application

• Who to ask for letters of reference (and who not to ask)

• What to include in your personal essay

• Which schools are accredited by the Council on Social Work Education, and why this is important

• Where to find out about social work licensing in your state.

NEW IN THIS EDITION (previous editions titled Guide to Selecting and Applying to Master of Social
Work Programs)—93 schools of social work provide tips to applicants and tell the most common mistakes
applicants make, and also provide information about their programs! Applicants’ tips for their peers are
included, as well.

Includes a complete directory of accredited schools of social work in the U.S., two chapters devoted to
writing your biographical statement, and worksheets to organize your applications.



Congressman Ciro D. Rodriguez, a master’s level social worker, wrote the foreword to this book, stating in
part, "Social work demands quality education, personal commitment, and endless practice. Choosing an
appropriate master's degree program is the first step along the lifelong path of the social worker. This guide
serves as a useful reference to help you in making that first, yet important, decision."
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From reader reviews:

Todd Jacobs:

Book is to be different for every grade. Book for children until eventually adult are different content. To be
sure that book is very important for all of us. The book The Social Work Graduate School Applicant's
Handbook: The Complete Guide To Selecting and Applying to MSW Programs has been making you to
know about other information and of course you can take more information. It is quite advantages for you.
The e-book The Social Work Graduate School Applicant's Handbook: The Complete Guide To Selecting and
Applying to MSW Programs is not only giving you considerably more new information but also for being
your friend when you feel bored. You can spend your own spend time to read your guide. Try to make
relationship together with the book The Social Work Graduate School Applicant's Handbook: The Complete
Guide To Selecting and Applying to MSW Programs. You never truly feel lose out for everything in case
you read some books.

Sharon Garcia:

Reading a reserve can be one of a lot of pastime that everyone in the world enjoys. Do you like reading book
therefore. There are a lot of reasons why people enjoyed. First reading a guide will give you a lot of new
data. When you read a book you will get new information simply because book is one of a number of ways
to share the information or perhaps their idea. Second, reading a book will make a person more imaginative.
When you reading through a book especially fictional book the author will bring someone to imagine the
story how the figures do it anything. Third, you may share your knowledge to other folks. When you read
this The Social Work Graduate School Applicant's Handbook: The Complete Guide To Selecting and
Applying to MSW Programs, you can tells your family, friends as well as soon about yours reserve. Your
knowledge can inspire the others, make them reading a publication.

Leonel Burton:

The Social Work Graduate School Applicant's Handbook: The Complete Guide To Selecting and Applying
to MSW Programs can be one of your beginner books that are good idea. Many of us recommend that
straight away because this reserve has good vocabulary that may increase your knowledge in words, easy to
understand, bit entertaining but still delivering the information. The article author giving his/her effort to get
every word into delight arrangement in writing The Social Work Graduate School Applicant's Handbook:
The Complete Guide To Selecting and Applying to MSW Programs although doesn't forget the main point,
giving the reader the hottest as well as based confirm resource facts that maybe you can be among it. This
great information can easily drawn you into brand new stage of crucial pondering.

Joan Beverly:

A number of people said that they feel bored stiff when they reading a e-book. They are directly felt it when
they get a half portions of the book. You can choose the particular book The Social Work Graduate School



Applicant's Handbook: The Complete Guide To Selecting and Applying to MSW Programs to make your
current reading is interesting. Your skill of reading ability is developing when you including reading. Try to
choose basic book to make you enjoy you just read it and mingle the sensation about book and reading
especially. It is to be initial opinion for you to like to wide open a book and learn it. Beside that the book The
Social Work Graduate School Applicant's Handbook: The Complete Guide To Selecting and Applying to
MSW Programs can to be your friend when you're sense alone and confuse in doing what must you're doing
of the time.
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