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"Don't suffer a child to be accused of a fault until you are perfectly aware he has been guilty of it" is one of
the many recommendations imparted within this historical booklet. Covering timeless topics such as
"Pregnancy and Childbirth," "Diet," "Sleep," and "Clothing," Don'ts for Mothers reveals motherhood as
viewed in the late 1800s. While the majority of the guidance is outdated and strikingly odd to modern
readers, this entertaining booklet still presents some insight into the world of motherhood today. Don'ts for
Mother's is an excellent read for anyone interested in the evolution of society who loves to be humorously
entertained. Also part of this series are Don'ts for Husbands and Don'ts for Wives, available from Cosimo
Classics. Though the author of Don'ts for Mothers is anonymous, it is suspected the author was Blanche
Ebbutt, 20th century author of two other etiquette guides written in the same vein and style, Don'ts for Wives
and Don'ts for Husbands.
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From reader reviews:

Dennis Thorpe:

Inside other case, little persons like to read book Don'ts for Mothers. You can choose the best book if you
want reading a book. As long as we know about how is important some sort of book Don'ts for Mothers. You
can add know-how and of course you can around the world by way of a book. Absolutely right, due to the
fact from book you can know everything! From your country till foreign or abroad you can be known. About
simple matter until wonderful thing you can know that. In this era, we could open a book or even searching
by internet product. It is called e-book. You need to use it when you feel bored to go to the library. Let's go
through.

Detra Satterwhite:

Reading a publication tends to be new life style on this era globalization. With reading you can get a lot of
information that can give you benefit in your life. With book everyone in this world can easily share their
idea. Textbooks can also inspire a lot of people. A lot of author can inspire their own reader with their story
or maybe their experience. Not only the story that share in the guides. But also they write about the
information about something that you need example of this. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach
your children, there are many kinds of book which exist now. The authors on earth always try to improve
their proficiency in writing, they also doing some study before they write for their book. One of them is this
Don'ts for Mothers.

Robin Castillo:

Your reading sixth sense will not betray a person, why because this Don'ts for Mothers reserve written by
well-known writer who really knows well how to make book which might be understand by anyone who else
read the book. Written inside good manner for you, dripping every ideas and composing skill only for
eliminate your current hunger then you still skepticism Don'ts for Mothers as good book not only by the
cover but also by the content. This is one book that can break don't ascertain book by its deal with, so do you
still needing one more sixth sense to pick this specific!? Oh come on your reading sixth sense already alerted
you so why you have to listening to another sixth sense.

Martina Lassiter:

Reading a book to become new life style in this season; every people loves to go through a book. When you
study a book you can get a large amount of benefit. When you read guides, you can improve your
knowledge, since book has a lot of information in it. The information that you will get depend on what types
of book that you have read. If you want to get information about your review, you can read education books,
but if you want to entertain yourself read a fiction books, these us novel, comics, along with soon. The
Don'ts for Mothers provide you with a new experience in examining a book.
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