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Facial Plastic and Reconstructive Surgery: Clinical Reference Guide is a portable reference guide that fills
the void of an easy to read, concise, but comprehensive book encompassing all aspects of facial plastic and
reconstructive surgery, both in the clinical setting as well as in preparing for board exams. Each chapter
follows a uniform outline to facilitate quick review of a topic, and the comprehensive nature of each chapter
provides the depth required for written and oral standardized tests. Chapters incorporate authors from all
specialties -- Facial Plastic and Reconstructive Surgery, General Plastic and Reconstructive Surgery,
Oculoplastic Surgery, and Dermatology -- as well as encompass all aspects of Facial Plastic and
Reconstructive Surgery, from cosmetic to reconstructive to craniofacial.Formatted like the bestselling
"Pasha" (Otolaryngology-Head and Neck Surgery) pocket guide, this text provides a condensed amount of
high-yield information with a multidisciplinary approach to bring a broader range of insight into complex
clinical challenges. Combining key insights from senior and junior authors, each chapter provides a unique
perspective on the relevant information needed by those getting themselves established within the field.

From the Foreword:
In today s world of ever expanding medical knowledge precise reference guides are in demand by practicing
physicians, residents and fellows in training, and medical students. Even better is a book that provides both a
comprehensive day-to-day clinical reference and board review source, and can fit into the pocket of a white
coat.

This text is a concise clinical reference guide solely devoted to facial plastic and reconstructive surgery. No
such portable guide has existed up till now. Dr. Desai has gathered an all star multidisciplinary group of
authors who are true experts in their fields. Many are paired with co-authors who recently finished training to
give a unique combined perspective on each topic. One could say that the chapters are written by former
trainees for present trainees . The result is an easily accessible reference guide organized to help the reader
find vital information quickly and efficiently.

Doctors in the specialties of facial plastic surgery, plastic surgery, oculoplastic surgery, oral and
maxillofacial surgery, and dermatology will find this guide indispensable in preparing for surgery or patient
care. Modeled after Dr. Raza Pasha s popular Otolaryngology Head and Neck Surgery Clinical Reference
Guide, this portable reference book fills a niche in the reference world left empty too long.

Ira D. Papel, MD
Associate Professor
Division of Facial Plastic and Reconstructive Surgery
Department of Otolaryngology Head and Neck Surgery
Johns Hopkins University School of Medicine

and

Patrick J. Byrne, MD
Professor and Director
Division of Facial Plastic and Reconstructive Surgery
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From reader reviews:

Will Cathcart:

Here thing why this Facial Plastic and Reconstructive Surgery: Clinical Reference Guide are different and
reputable to be yours. First of all reading through a book is good nevertheless it depends in the content than it
which is the content is as tasty as food or not. Facial Plastic and Reconstructive Surgery: Clinical Reference
Guide giving you information deeper and in different ways, you can find any e-book out there but there is no
reserve that similar with Facial Plastic and Reconstructive Surgery: Clinical Reference Guide. It gives you
thrill studying journey, its open up your own eyes about the thing in which happened in the world which is
perhaps can be happened around you. You can easily bring everywhere like in recreation area, café, or even
in your approach home by train. Should you be having difficulties in bringing the branded book maybe the
form of Facial Plastic and Reconstructive Surgery: Clinical Reference Guide in e-book can be your
substitute.

Jessica Keith:

Why? Because this Facial Plastic and Reconstructive Surgery: Clinical Reference Guide is an unordinary
book that the inside of the book waiting for you to snap it but latter it will zap you with the secret that inside.
Reading this book adjacent to it was fantastic author who also write the book in such remarkable way makes
the content inside of easier to understand, entertaining way but still convey the meaning completely. So , it is
good for you because of not hesitating having this nowadays or you going to regret it. This excellent book
will give you a lot of benefits than the other book include such as help improving your skill and your critical
thinking means. So , still want to hold off having that book? If I had been you I will go to the publication
store hurriedly.

John Ward:

The book untitled Facial Plastic and Reconstructive Surgery: Clinical Reference Guide contain a lot of
information on the idea. The writer explains her idea with easy means. The language is very straightforward
all the people, so do not worry, you can easy to read that. The book was published by famous author. The
author brings you in the new age of literary works. It is easy to read this book because you can read on your
smart phone, or program, so you can read the book within anywhere and anytime. If you want to buy the e-
book, you can available their official web-site and order it. Have a nice study.

Joyce Jiminez:

Do you like reading a reserve? Confuse to looking for your chosen book? Or your book seemed to be rare?
Why so many query for the book? But almost any people feel that they enjoy to get reading. Some people
likes reading, not only science book but in addition novel and Facial Plastic and Reconstructive Surgery:
Clinical Reference Guide or others sources were given knowledge for you. After you know how the truly
great a book, you feel desire to read more and more. Science e-book was created for teacher or maybe



students especially. Those textbooks are helping them to bring their knowledge. In various other case, beside
science publication, any other book likes Facial Plastic and Reconstructive Surgery: Clinical Reference
Guide to make your spare time much more colorful. Many types of book like here.
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